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WILLIAM RAINEY HARPER COLLEGE
34 West Palatine Road
Palatine, Illinois 60067

AGENDA
May 11, 1967

Call to Order

Roll Call

Approval of Minutes

Approval of Bills

Communications

Unfiﬁished Business

A, Discussion - Restaurant zoning petition adjacent to
college property and report of meeting with Palatine

Village Board and Planning Commaission.

New Business

A, Recommendation - Teaching Staff (Exhibit A)

B. Recommendation - Approval of Dental Hygienics Program
(Exhibit B)

C. Evaluation and Recommendation - Awarding Bids on
Temporary Facilities (Exhibit C)

D. Other Items

President's Report

A.
Bo

Adjournment



WILLIAM RAINFEY HARPER COLLEGE

34 W. PALATINE RD. e PALATINE, ILLINOIS 60067 ¢ AREA CODE 312 358-9100

May 4, 1967

Board of Trustees

Dear Trustee:

Enclosed is the Agenda and supporting information for the regular
Board meeting to be held on Thursday, May 11, 1967, Elk Grove
High School Faculty Lounge, 500 Elk Grove Boulevard, Elk Grove
Village, Illinois at 8:00 P, M. You will note that the supporting
information for Exhibit C will be hand-carried to the board meet-
ing.

I shall look forward to seeing you at the Elk Grove facilities on
May 11, 1967 at eight o'clock in the evening.

Sincerely,
e [t ¢
%ﬂb/ { &,LM

Robert E. Lahti
President

REL:jal
Enclosures



WILLIAM RAINEY HARPER COLLEGE
BOARD OF JUNIOR COLLEGE DISTRICT 512
COUNTY OF COOK, STATE OF ILLINOIS

Minutes of the Regular Board Meeting, Thursday, May 11, 1967.

CALL TO ORDER:

ROLL CALL:

MINUTES :

INVOICES:

In the absence of President Haas and a quorum
being present, it was moved by Member O 'Dea,
seconded by Member Nicklas, and unanimously
carried that Member Bernstein serve as president
pro tempore.

The meeting of the Board of Junior College District
No. 512 was called to order at 8:35 p.m. by president
pro tempore Bernstein at 500 Elk Grove Boulevard,

Elk Grove Village, Illinois.

Present: Bernstein, Hamill, Nicklas, and O'Dea.
Absent: Johnson, Hansen, and Haas.

Also present: Elaine Mehlman, Paddock Publications,
Inc.; Charles N. Shaner, Dental Advisory Committee;
Charlene Baron, League of Women Voters; Ralph P.
Klatt, Des Plaines Suburban Times; John Upton, Roy
Sedrel, Dr. James Harvey, Dr. James D. Perry, and
Dr. Lahti, Harper College; Frank Hines, Attorney.

President Haas entered the meeting at 8:37 p.m.
Subsequently, president pro tempore Bernstein: re-
linquished the chair, and president Haas assumed
his duties as president.

Member Bernstein moved and Member O'Dea seconded the
motion to approve the minutes of the regular board
meeting of Thursday, April 27, 1967 with the follow-
ing corrections: Under Personnel Recommendations,
Mr. George Makas, change Assistant Professor to read
Associate Professor; under Presentation of Temporary
Facilities, add to the motion by Member Johnson as
follows: Member Johnson moved and Member O 'Dea
seconded the motion to approve this plan and give
permission to proceed accordingly.

Motion carried.

Member Hamill moved and Member Bernstein seconded
the motion to approve for payment the payroll of
May 31, 1967 in the amount of $22,684.87 and the
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INVOICES: invoices of May 11, 1967 as follows:
(Continued)
Educational Fund . . . . . §$ 32,546.99
Building Fund. . . . . . . 2,560.83
Site & Construction Fund . 127,684.00

$162,791.82
Upon roll call, the vote was as follows:

Aye: Bernstein, Hamill, Nicklas, O'Dea, and Haas.
Nay: None

COMMUNICATIONS : A communication was received relative to the Loyola
Conference to be held on May 22 and 23 for junior
college administrators and board members. Drs. Lahti
and Pankratz, and Members Nicklas and Hamill ex-
pressed an interest in attending this meeting.

UNFINISHED br. Lahti reviewed the highlights of the joint
BUSINESS: meeting held with the Palatine Planning Commission
Discussion of and the Palatine Village Board on Tuesday, May 2d,
Restaurant in the Palatine Village Hall. He reviewed the pre-
Zoning Petition sentation made by the petitioners and stated that

& Report of as he understood the situation, the proposed build-
Meeting ings had been changed considerably from those earlier

contemplated. He indicated that the Planning Commis-
sion and Village Board were willing to cooperate in
a pre-annexation plan development. Furthermore,
there was a general agreement that the petitioners,
the Planning Commission, the Village Board and the
junior college board should sit down and consider
all present and subsequent proposals for zoning
changes within this area. Subsequent to this meet-
ing, the Planning Commission had gone on record to
approve both the gas station and the restaurant
zoning requested by the peititioners.

Mrs. Nicklas stated it would be helpful to the board
to be able to sit down with this group to determine
what would be best for the entire community in this
area. She further indicated that it was not our in-
tention to impose our ideas on the group but to work
on an overall plan to maintain some architectural
control for buildings within this area. She felt
this type of area planning was in the best interest
of Harper College.

President Haas stated that the board had received
assurance from the Planning Commission and the Village
Board that it would be possible to review the general
architectural plans and drawings for buildings pro-
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UNFINISHED
BUSINESS
Discussion of
Restaurant
Zoning Petition
& Report of
Meeting (Contd.)

Discussion of
Motion

posed for this area. He stated we would continue
to be concerned about the type of usage which
would be compatible to our thinking. He further
stated that the Planning Commission had received a
commitment from Standard 0Oil Company to go along
with the general building characterisitics of the
area. The petitioners presented a new proposal
for a restaurant in terms of developing a building
similar to a Heritage House or a Scandia House for
this area.

Member Hamill indicated he still objected to the
placement of a gas station adjacent to the junior
college property and felt something should be done
to prevent this from happening.

Member Bernstein indicated he was disappointed in
the outcome but felt we had stated our case and
that at "this stage of the game" the Planning
Commission'’s decision seemed final. In addition,
he stated that they must see something that we do
not in their overall planning.

Member Bernstein moved and Member Nicklas seconded
the motion to send a letter to the Village Board

and the Planning Commission thanking them for the
time and effort spent in our behalf yet expressing
our disappointment even though we recognize that

the total area planning was their concern. In addi-
tion, the letter should state that we appreciate the
courtesy, consideration, and time given by this

group to consider our recent resolution and the fact
that we want to keep open the possibility of becoming
involved in the planning of the entire area surround-
ing the college.

Member Hamill felt we should have legal counsel in-
vestigate all possible grounds for objecting to the
approval of the petitioners request because he felt
it was our duty to protect the college and the
general architectural characteristics of the entire
area.

Member O'Dea moved that the motion be amended to state
the letter not be sent, but should be prepared to be
presented before the entire board at the next regular
meeting.
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UNFINISHED
BUSINESS
Discussion of
Restaurant
Zoning Petition
& Report of
Meeting (Contd.)

PERSONNEL
RECOMMENDATIONS

DENTAL HYGIENE
PROGRAM

This amendment was accepted by Members Bernstein
and Nicklas.

Upon roll call, the vote was as follows:

Aye: Bernstein, Hamill, Nicklas, O'Dea, and Haas.
Nay: None

Dr. Lahti presented, for board consideration, the
credentials of Mr. Roger A. Mussel and recommended
his appointment as a staff member for Harper College.

Member O'Dea moved and Member Hamill seconded the
motion to approve the appointment of Roger A.

Mussell, Assistant Professor of Electronics, effective
September 11, 1967, for the 1967-68 school year, at

an annual salary of $10,150.

Upon roll call, the vote was as follows:

Aye: Bernstein, Hamill, Nicklas, O'Dea, and Haas.
Nay: ©None

At this point, Dr. Lahti stated that, in the near
future, the administration would be bringing to the
board an electronics program and advisory committee
recommendation, for their approval.

Dr. Harvey reviewed the proposal for the establish-
ment of a Dental Hygiene Program as presented in the
agenda. He indicated the program is being projected
to start in the fall of 1968. The first year program
will be primarily general education. The second year
will emphasize a clinical program to be housed in our
new facilities.

Dr. Charles Shaner, Chairman of the Avisory Committee,
was present and responded to questions in regard to
the plans of the committee and the staff. He stated
there is a definite need for staff and facilities to
train Dental Hygienists because most dental schools
need all their time and facilities to train the
dentists. He also stated that the Dental Hygienist
works primarily (in the mouth) under the supervision
of a dentist in cleaning, x-raying, and the applica-
tion of topical flouride. He further stated a dental
assistant was one who provided a second pair of hands
for the dentist and assisted him at the chair. He
emphasized that our program should not exclude the
possibility of training males as well as females.
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DENTAL HYGIENE
PROGRAM
(Continued)

BIDS ON
TEMPORARY
FACILITIES

General Contractor

Dr. Lahti stated we would like to start a talent
search for the director of our dental program and
asked for an informal commitment to proceed with
interviews to find a person to start half time on

July 1, 1967 and possibly full time on January 1, 1968.
He stated the Vocational Educational Act would provide
100% of the initial equipment cost and 66% of the
salary cost, effective July 1, 1968. He recommended
the board adopt this program and give permission to
proceed to interview individuals for the directorship.

Member O'Dea moved and Member Bernstein seconded the

motion to approve the Dental Hygiene Program and
give an informal commitment to proceed in the quest
for a program director.

Upon roll call, the vote was as follows:

Aye: Bernstein, Hamill, Nicklas, O'Dea, and Haas.
Nay: None

Drs. Lahti and Perry outlined the problems encountered
at Elk Grove in the site preparation for relocatable
facilities. It was indicated that bids had been
solicited throughout the junior college district,
through advertising in accordance with board policy,
and that we were in receipt of bids as follows:

Prime Base

Walson Construction,

Bensenville, Ill.

Lake States Corp.
Park Ridge

Meyer & Gebhardt
Chicago

Electrical Contractor

Midwest Interstate
Chicago

Mid-America Electric

Palatine

Northbrook Electric

Northbrook

Bid I Prime Base General Base
(Site Pre- Bid IT Bid III
paration (Electrical) (Combined)
$22,725.00 $5,500.00 $28,225.00
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

$7,563.00

5,830.00

6,311.00
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BIDS ON
TEMPORARY
FACILITIES
(Continued)

Jack
Vandermyn

It was further indicated that on May 10th bids were
opened by members from the firm of Fridstein and
Fitch and the business office staff of Harper College.
Because of the time of the year and the size of the
job, few contractors were willing to bid on this
project.

Dr. Lahti and Perry recommended that the Board of
Trustees award the site preparation and electrical
contract to the low bidder, the Walson Construction
Company, Bensenville, Illinois for a total bid of
$28,225.

Member Hamill moved and Member Bernstein seconded the
motion to accept the low general contract bid of the
Walson Construction Company of Bensenville, Illinois
in the amount of $28,225.

Upon roll call, the vote was as follows:

Aye: Bernstein, Hamill, Nicklas, O'Dea, and Haas.
Nay: None

Member O'Dea indicated to the board that Mr. Jack
Vandermyn, presently associated with the Day Publi-
cations, was moving out of the area and felt the
board should do something to commend him for the
service he rendered in the early development of
Harper College.

Member O'Dea moved and Member Bernstein seconded the
motion to adopt the following resolution commending
Mr. Jack Vandermyn for his outstanding public service
and invaluable assistance to the college and extend-
ing to him our best wishes for future happiness and
success.

RESOLUTTION

In recognition of his wvital role in an
untiring support to the early development
of the junior college district,

His continued efforts to inform the public
of educational issued and their salient aspects,

His unswerving dedication to high journalistic
principles, his interest in, and devotion to,
the progress and future of the Northwest
Suburban Area,
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Jack Vandermyn
(Continued)

OTHER ITEMS:
Student
Application
Report

Illinois Junior
College Board

Board of Higher
Education

Junior College
Board Meeting
at Belleville

RESOLUTTION

The Board of Trustees of Junior College
District No. 512, William Rainey Harper
College, commends Mr. Jack Vandermyn for
his outstanding public service and his
invaluable assistance in the early years
of this community college and extends to
him its wishes for future success and
happiness.

Upon roll call, the vote was as follows:

Aye: Bernstein, Hamill, Nicklas, O'Dea, and Haas.
Nay: None

Dr. Lahti reported that to date we had 517 student
applications on file and indicated that he felt
this was excellent progress.

Dr. Lahti stated that a meeting of the Illinois
Junior College Board would be held Friday morning,
May 1l6th to review the established guidelines with
the six colleges involved in Phase 1-B. He further
stated that the Illinois Junior College Board may
take a different action from that of the Board of
Higher Education and call upon out of state exprerts
to review the present proposal.

Member Bernstein reported on the action taken by the
Board of Higher Education relative to the guidelines
for the allocation of capital funds for junior
colleges. He stated that he was disappointed, not
only in the lack of involvement allowed at the meeting
but the meager amount of background information on
which their guideline decisions were based.

Mrs. Nicklas reported on a recent meeting for board
members and administrators, held in Bdleville on

May 5 and 6. She indicated that twenty-two public
junior colleges, ten private colleges and six univer-
sities were represented at the meeting. Items of
discussion related to legislation and proposed guide-
lines for the allocation of capital construction cost.
She indicated that a resolution was prepared and passed
relating to adjustments that the Illinois Junior
College Association felt should be made in the guide-
lines recently approvedby the Board of Higher Educa-
tion. She felt this was an encouraging meeting. It
was the consensus of the opinion of the group that
this was a good organization which should be continued
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OTHER ITEMS:
Junior College

Bd. Meeting at
Beleville (Contd.)

Legislative
Meeting

Junior College
Conference in
Topeka, Kansas

Athletic
Conference

Working Drawings
on future bldgs.

and would become more influencial in providing
information relative to the needs of all colleges
in the State of Illinois.

Dr. Lahti reported on a dinner meeting recently held
in Springfield with legislators, board presidents and
college presidents, to discuss recent legislation
affecting junior college districts. The meeting

was arranged by James Broman who is presently keeping
on top of all current legislation affecting junior
colleges.

Dr. Lahti stated that he and Richard Johnson had
attended a junior college conference held in Topeka,
Kansas. One-hundred percent of all Kansas Junior
College Board Members were in attendance and indi-
cated an interest in the problems and solutions of
other states.

Dr. Harvey gave a brief report relative to a recent
meeting in St. Charles for the Northern Illinois
Athletic Conference. He stated that Harper College
had been accepted as a member of this conference and
was assigned to the Eastern Division. Harper College
was included in their 1968-69 schedule for both base-
ball and basketball competition. He further stated
that a final authorization for a student financial
aid program had been approved by the Federal Govern-
ment and that we would receive a Federal Grant in the
total amount of $21,000. In addition, he related to
the board the progress in the development of a student
government organization for Harper College. He asked
the board for authorization to proceed with the deve-
lopment of a student government, to make a determina-
tion on appropriate school colors and a college nick-
name. He stated this organization would begin work
on a constitution to be brought before the board at

a later date.

At this point, Member Hamill asked about the possible
development of working drawings on future buildings
in order to be ready at the time money becomes avail-
able from the State.

Dr. Lahti felt we should wait until the present
appropriation was settled and at that time, the junior
college board will take another look at the total
state picture to see if additional money will be
available for this purpose.
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OTHER ITEMS:
(Continued)

House Bill
No. 1264

Adjournment:

et

/ $//z<4{,¢/ \};omé ) ) )

Member Bernstein related to the board the progress of
House Bill No. 1264 and indicated the bill came out
of committee on a "Do Pass Bisis". He indicated a
number of amendments had been made to the bill but
felt they were good amendments since they were reason-
able. The majority of objections came from the Tax-
payers' Association, the Agriculture Committee, and
the Railroad League.

Dr. Lahti stated that this would provide additional
monies to us and other junior colleges to obtain
moveable equipment for each college. Monies for this
purpose were not provided for in our recent referendum
as we had no knowledge at the time that moveable
equipment would not be eligible for state partici-
pation.

Member Bernstein indicated that if this legislation
seemed desirable to the board, it might be incumbent
for us to send a letter to Mr. James Broman, Executive
Secretary of the Illinois State Junior College Assoc-
iation, indicating that we are in favor of recommend-
ing the passage of this bill.

Member Bernstein moved and Member Nicklas seconded

the motion to send a letter to James Broman, Executive
Secretary of the Illinois State Junior College Assoc-

iation, expressing our approval of House Bill No. 1264
and recommending passage by the illinois State Legis-

lature.

Upon roll call, the vote was as follows:

Aye: Bernstein, Hamill, Nicklas, O'Dea, and Haas.
Nay: None

At 10:40 p.m., Member Nicklas moved and Member O'Dea
seconded the motion to adjourn. Motion carried.

/P%%51dent Haas

,Secretary Nicklas

e
-
o
-

///



IMPREST FUND DISBURSEMENTS
APRIL 4, 1967 to APRIL 31, 1967

PAYEE DESCRIPTION CHECK NUMBER AMOUNT
Clearing House for F.S. & T.I. Book 389 $ 3.00
Microcard Corp Book 390 4.00
Conrad Hilton Travel Expense - Dr. Lahti 391 37.51
Ray Soucie Parking Fees 392 10.00
Ruth Lahti Travel Expense - Dr. Lahti 393 45.017
American Express Travel Expense - Dr. Perry 394 47.18
Supt. of Documents Book 395 1.00
William Layman Election Supervisor Expenses 396 21.60
Donald Hipple Election Supervisor Expenses 397 22.48
Robert Grabitz Election Supervisor Expenses 398 24.48
Ralph Beasley Election Supervisor Expenses 399 22.40
Gerald Kiffle Election Supervisor Expenses 400 26.40
Keith Vernon Election Supervisor Expenses 401 23.60
George Gattas Election Supervisor Expenses 402 24.40
Robert Cizek Election Supervisor Expenses 403 27.36
Henry Williams Election Supervisor Expenses 404 26.80
William J. Senne Election Supervisor Expenses 405 22.40
Earl Benoche Election Supervisor Expenses 406 25.20
Joseph Wanner Election Supervisor Expenses 407 27.44
C. J. Melichar Election Supervisor Expenses 408 26.64
Void 409

William Eitemiller Election Supervisor Expenses 410 25.92
Frederick Lauterburg Election Supervisor Expenses 411 27.04
Donald Williams Election Supervisor Expenses 412 24.72
Righter Farris Election Supervisor Expenses 413 25.44
Roy Sedrel Election Supervisor Expenses 414 20.00
Anton Dole js Election Supervisor Expenses 415 24.24
Donald Arseneau Election Supervisor Expenses 416 26.64
Eleanor Williams Election Supervisor Expenses 4117 20.00
Postmaster U. S. Postage 418 25.00
Void 419

Saturday Review Subscription 420 8.00
American Council on Education Book 421 2.00
Ziff Davis Service Div. Books 422 2.80
The Nelsons Flowers 423 8.50
I11. Assn. of Education Secys. Travel - E. Williams 424 11.35
Harold Cunningham Educational Consultant 425 193.75
Julia "A. Leonard Travel Advance 426 100.00
Donn Stansbury Travel Advance 421 133.00
Thomas Zimangl Travel - Faculty 428 43.170
Natl. Academy of Sciences Book 429 2.00
U.S. Govt. Printing Office Book 430 1.00
Don Klingenberg Travel - Applicant 431 44.170
John Gelch Travel - Faculty 432 24.10
Helen Montague Travel - Applicant 433 9.50
Dr. Pankratz Travel - Advance 434 25.00
Dr. Harvey Travel - Advance 435 31.00
Il11. Notary Ass'n. Notary Fee 436 17.95
Void 437

Eleanor Williams Travel Advance 438 30.00
Roy Sedrel Travel Advance 439 23.00

Kenneth Parker Travel Advance 440 26.00



IMPREST FUND DISBURSEMENT Cont'd. April 4, 1967 to April 31, 1967

PAYEE

Roy A. Sedrel

Kenneth Parker

Illinois Ass'n. of Jr. Colleges
The Nelsons

Van's Paint Store

Randhurst Camera Shop
Harper & Row Pub. Inc.
Northwest Letter Service

C & S Printing Co.

The Univ. of Mich, Press
Sheraton O'Hare Motor Inn
Roger Garrison

Council of State Gov'ts.
U.C. L. A. Student's Store
Void

Institutional Research Council, Inc.

DESCRIPTION

Travel - Advance
Travel - Advance
Meeting Expense
Flowers

Art Supplies

Photo Supplies

Book

Addressograph Plates
Printing

Book

Consultant Accomodations
Consultants Fees
Book

Books

Book

American Personnel and Guidance Ass'n. Subscription

Prentice Hall, Inc.
World Almanac
Donn B. Stansbury
Stanley A. Lotko
Walsworth Publ. Co.
Dr. Robert E. Lahti
Eleanor Williams

D. B. Stansbury

Dr. Pankratz

Mrs. Nicholas

Book

Book

Travel

Travel

Book

Petty Cash Reimbursement
Petty Cash Reimbursement
Return of Cash

Return of Cash

O'Hare Meeting

441
442
443
444
445
446
4417
448
449
450
451
452
453
454
455
456
4517
458
459
460
461
462
463
464

CHECK NUMBER

AMOUNT

$ 100.00

100.00

30.00
.20
.25
.80
.82
.50
.07
.95
31.170
100.00
.00
.30

A O =1 W 00 00 00

o o

.00
.00
.61
.00
.20
.25
.00
.38
106.79
(27. 46)
( 8.15)

W DD UBw oo WD

=
o]

(180.00)

TOTAL PETTY CASH DISBURSEMENTS $.1,965.12



06°20T
00°9€T
0G6°8¢€%
00°0SS

€6°65¢

00°6T
96°¢¥
00°ST
00°18
06°€9
68°L6
¢5"09%
68°8%
§9°6%

¥2°S18

T12°8L%

00°0%
G398
$6°S¥L
05°2T% $

LNNOWV
JOdHD

G09S
7188
€16¢S
GIGS

TTSS

0TGS
60GS
80G¢S
L0GS
906¢S
G0GS
¥0SS
€06¢S
G0SS

T0SS

006S

66%S
86%S
L6%S
96%S

JIIINNN
ADFIHD

08°30T
00°9¢€T
05863
00°0G¢
007003
€1°6¢
08°L3
0S°LLZ
00°6T
9¢°e¥
00°GT
00°T18
06°€9
68°L6
35" 093
68°83
G662
oL"¢
0% L8¢e
00°68¢
$8°%H
38° 9%
00°6%
083
961
89°%2
00°LT
ST $61
00°9
00" 0%
G298
G6EPL
00° 68T
0S8°L2% $

INNONWV
ILNNODDV

€8°10G-¢-1

sorrddng

GL°T0G- -T TaARITL
6£°20G-2-1 soo1AIaS otydeiSoioyd
9%°%06-1-1 1UBINSUOD)
63°T0G-1-T 1We1NSU0D)
€6°20G-€6-T SPY ueMm
€6°10G-¢-T PV 1uem
ge°T10G-8-T sar1ddng uor1091g
€6°106-6-1 soryddns
28°106-6-1 sorrddng
€8°10G-3-1 Sunutyg
GE T106-€-1 150D UOTI09TH
GE°T0G-6-T 150D UOTI09Tq
GE T10G-6-T 150D UO0T10914q
68 T10G6-6-T sor1ddng uor1091g
T€°10G-9-1 sorrddns
6€°205-€9-1 sor1ddng
T€°106-9-1 sorrddng
00°€9G-86-T 1o11imadA ],
00°€9G6-0-T 1o11Imad AT
1€°T0G-¢-1T soriddng
00°€9G-¢-T soriddng
68°30G-£9-T sorrddng
68£°206-2G-T sorrddng
L€ 306-8G-T sorrddng
T€°10G-%-1 sorrddns
%8 10G-8-1 so11ddng
T€°T06-¢-T sor7ddng
T€'T0G-T-T sorrddng
65 T0G-1-1 soo1A1aS o1ydeidoioyd
65°T0G-1-1 sao1A19S o1ydeidoloyd
63°T0G-1-1 $901AIaS Sunnsuod
2% 108-6-1 509 18897
2Z°10G-1-1 sooq 188917
YIIINON NOILdI¥OSId

INNODOV
L9BT‘IT AVIN

L9009 SIONITII ‘ANILVIVd

gIg °
IO0dT100 Yddy

LOI41SI1d
AINIVY IWVITIIM

ZUIy *J UeWISY

moJ % [9ARIL [9SNOIRD
£ydeiSoioyd 1orvyoIRN soulef
10U203 *7T 1eqoy

12400 *7 11940y

SUOT1BOTIqNd }00pped
SUOTIBOTIqNd Yoopped
suoneorIqnd ¥oopped

Sunutig 108ue

wysog "M ‘3

s1o119s9d£ 1, s1oysIIqnd

Ul 9ATIQ 191500y pay

$13 101SIQ T00Y9S yS1H drysumor
1% *1SIJ [00YOS PalepI[osuo) Arunwiuion)
0D Iaquioyl Yuelj

SISpIOH

0D s1onpoid qel

‘0D s1onpoid qel

SOUIYD BN SSOUISNY [BUOTIRUISIUT
SOUTYORIAl SSOUTSNG [BUOTIRUISIU]
SOUIYORIA SSOUISNY [BUOTIRUISIUT
SISUOTIBIS [BSISATU()

SISUOTIEIS [BSISATU[)

SISUOTIBIS [BSISATU[)

SISUOT1B1S [BSISATU()

SISUOTIB1S [BSISATU(

SISUOTIEIS TESIDATU[)

SISUOTIB1S TBSISATUN)

SISUOTIR1S [BSISATU[)
Aydei13oroyd 1oryDIRIN SowE[
soIpmis plepuels

uorierodion xodwy

souTy N Yueig

SOUTH "N Muelj

J4AvVd

STINIIANAdXd dNNd TYNOILvVONdd



00°€0%

00°0T

TL ¥LL S
00°6
SL°€9

gL LL

Ggs ee
L% G¥3

0928
S6° 113G
€6°586

¥9°866

L¥°19¢
09°6T
00°G
00°ST
00°32T
00°03
00703
S0°T¥
ST'9%

vL°QS
06°L%
0832
82°9%

0%°88
08°6%
06°%

69°€L

87" 1%
8L°3T

03" %81
007008 ¢

| LNNOWV

XO3FHO

LvSS 00" LTT L€'20G6-€5-1
00798 00°€9G-86-1
9¥%6¢ 00°0T 00°696-€G6-T
5444 TL PLL S 00°€96-€6-T
144 00°6 00°€96-€6-1
€¥GS GL"€9 00°€96-€6-T
(4744 gL LL 00°€9G-€G-T
%56 GG'ge 00'€9G-g5-T
0%SS [ ¢al 29°80G6-T-T
G6°032T 39°805-6-T
6668 09°2¢ 00°89G6-2G-T
865G S6° 113G 00°€96-0-T
LESS LT €9T 00°€9G-¢-T
96 °8%L 00°€9G-¢-T
0%°€3 19°80G6- -T
986G LS"S¥8 T16°80G- -T
LO"EGT €G°80G-- T
segel Ly 19¢ T9°806- -T
$€38S 09°6T G6°205-G-T
£86¢S 00°¢G 66°20G-2S-T
(4344 00°GT 66°20G-3S-T
T€SS 00°2T 66°20G-€9-T
066¢S 00703 66°T0G-8-T
63SS 007032 66°T0G-€-T
8435S S0°T¥ S6°10G-3-T
L2SS 019 G6°30G-€9-T
09°¢ G6°205-9-T1
06°LT G6°T10G-3-T
GS°8T G6°T0G-T-T
93668 L"0S G6°T0G-T-T
G3SS 0G6°L3 €6°206-9-1
1444 08733 €6°T0G-%-T
€868 87" %% €6°20S-9-1
08°T €6°T06-6-1
(444 0288 €6°T0G-€-1
135S 08°6% €6°T0S-€-1
03GS 06'% T16°T0S-T-T
6TSS G8°9¢ TL*T0G-T-T
¥8°9¢ 6L°T0G-€-T
8TGS 8% TV CL*30G-2G-T
LTGS 8L"3T SL T0S--T1
91S¢ 02" %8T 66°20G-9-T
GTSS 00°00e ¢ 9%°20S-T-1
JIINNN INNONWV ATINNON
ADdHD LNNODDV LNNODDOV

sorrddng

sor7ddng

yoog

$yoog

joog

syoog

syoog

3oog

Teiusy - 18D

[eiuay - uoSem uoTIBLIS
SuOTITIIRd

autyoeN Suneioig
o1eog SuriTeN
I01B][0D

TeIUSY SUIYOIBN
souemsyu] aafordwyg
souemsu] asfordurg
Te1USY SUTYDBIN
asuadxyg Suniosy
uoneutwexy askordwyg
uonjeurwexy aokordwg
uoneurwexy safordwyg
uonieutwexy sokordwy
uoneurwexy aofordwyg
asuadxqg SunieoN
asuadxyg Sunesin
asuadxg SunssN
asuadxg Suneay
asuadxg SunieaN
asuadxg SuneoN

sIoy101g pIoTdeD

s191101g pIo[Aeo

mog Y ¥

Surssoooi1d yoog Ieuely
skoo®1g

Kuedwo) yoieasay a1eD
1014e] 2% 1oXeY

ssa1d 08eoryD jo LIIsIaATU[]
1eIUSy 18D Jone]

TeIUSy IBD JOne]

KuedwoD pue ¥ongaoy sieas
BOOA

somog- Kauitd

somog- Kauitdg

somog- Kauid

*0D *suJ [eriuspnid

*0D °suJ [erauspnid
uotieiodio) xolex

B11919J8D T00UDS YSTH 24019 M1
K101810qET TROTPaN UOISUITIY
*d "W ‘QuodT g °17 *1d

*d "IN ‘99pnH ‘1T ¥ *id

*d "N ‘uetIDAd) "I

*ad "W ¢ Asmordaryd "NV CId
qniD 20YSaSIOH

SUOTSSIOUOD) UISISOM
SUOTSSOOUOD) UISISOM
SUOTSSOUO0D) UIISOM
SUOTSSOOUOD) UISISOM

2IRH,O UOIRISYS

diysrequiay *J0SSY 90UBPIND 2 [9UUOSISd UBDTISWY

PV 1UEM 0D SUTysTIqNd UBDTISWY YIION

PV uem suoned11qnd £eQ

pV 1uem suoTieo1Iqnd Aed

pV uem sunqui], oSeotyd

20110N 18897 - UOTIBOTIqNd 28eITIA 24019 Y17 Jo 98e(IIA
Joog I91US) UOTINQIISI UBTITINORIA ISII0D

[oARIL 11O piepueis

1oARLL 110 piepueis

ToARILL ATutoy °1 suueof

ToARIL IoNIed "M Ylsuuad

Sunutig *0D SursnisApy sswe[ pue 997

1UB1I[NSUOD) [RUOTIBONDH *ouJ soTweud( [BUOTIONISU]
NOILdINO SId d4AVd

L96T "TT AVIN -

STNLIANAdXT Q%h . TYNOILVONAdd



00°20T
00°20T
00°6TT
0G°6S
00°20T
0S°9L
0S°¢€6
S0°0T9
0G ¢eL
0G"¢EL
0G°89T
00°$63
00°¥6%
00°%¥63
00°692
00°%62
G8°8%T
00°3TT
00°3TT
00°20T
00°2¢
00" 0%
00°9¢T
00708
00°%32
0096
00796
00°%2
00°9¢T
00°%3
00°2Lg
S0°9T
GL*€¢
08° 16

Gg°Ge
86°€61
G2 9€%
00°SG3
00703
%81

$

ILNNOWV
JOFHO

08°206-G-T
08°20G-G-1
08°20G-G-T
08°20S-G-T
087306-6-1
08°20G6-6-T
08°20S-G-T
08°206-G-T
08°206-6-1
08°3%0S-G-T
08°20S-G-T
08°20S-G-T
08°306-S-1
08°20G-G-T
08°20G-G-T
08°20S-G-T
08°30G6-6-T
08°206-6-T
08°206-S-1
08°206-G-T
08°20S-G-T
08°20S-G-T
08°3%0G6-G6-T
08°20S-G-T
08°30G-G-1
08°20S-G-T
08°20S-G-T
08°306-G-T
08°20G-G-T
08°20G-G-T
08°3806-6-T
00°€96-€G-T
00°€96-€66-T
LE7306-6G-1
00°€96-66-1
00°696-€G6-T
00°€96-6G-T
00°€96-86-1
00°€96-8G-1
00°€96-66-1
00°€96-6G-T

L8SS 00°20T
9869 00°20T
G8GS 00°6TT
¥86S 0G°6¢S
€866 00°20T
3858 0G6°9L
186S 0G°€6
0868 G0°0T9
6LSS 0G"¢EL
8LSS 0G 8L
LLSG 06891
9LSS 00°¥63
GLSS 00°%¥63¢
LGS 00°¥6%
€LSS 00°692
GLSS 00°¥6¢
TLSS G8°8%T
0LSS 00°3TT
696G 00°2TT
8969 00°20T
L9SS 0028
9966 00°0¥%
G9G¢ 00°9€T
7968 00708
€9G6¢S 00°%2
398S 00°96
T96S 00°96
098¢ 00°%2
6SGS 00°9€T
866G 00°%%
LGSS 00°2L%
96S¢ 09T
GGGS GL'€¢
$GSS 08°12
00°0L
€G6GS Ge°ge
3GSS 86°€6T
168G 63983
0GSS 00°G6S3
6¥S¢S 0002
8%S5S e7°8T ¢
JIGINNON INNONWVY
X0FHD LNNODOOV

YIIINNN
LNNODDV

yoeg 2818yD

Jyoeg a81eyD
yoeg 281eyD
3yoeg a81eyD
3yoeg 281eyD
yoeg 281eyD
yoeg 281eyD
yoeg 281eyD
yorg 281eyD
yoeg a81eyD
3yoeg a81eyD
3yoeg 981eyD
yoeg 281eyD
yoeg 281eyD
3yoeg a81eyD
yoeg 281eyD
yoeg a81eyD
yoeg a81eyD
yoeg a81eyD
yoeg a31eyD
yoeg a81eyD
yoeg 281eyD
yoeg 281eyD
yoeg 281eyD
yoeg a81eyD
yoeg 281eyD
yoeg a81eyD
Jyoeg a81eyD
yoerg a81eyD
yoeg a81eyD
yoeg a81eyD
oog

sjoog
so17ddng-
$joog

$y004

004
1o11amad L],
$yoog

004

oog

NOILdINOSAA

L96T ‘IT AVIN

uasie] 119qoy
juef1g uyof

UBTISTIYD SURI(

YOo0ppeID uyof

wonsua 119qoy

uyof [o1uEq

7107 UOIRYS

9821100 IoTUN[ UOITIT
a1doq wiL

USUAMIDY UBA JoUB[
oanyo praeq

KaureD uyof

D{SUIP{NY audem

STMOT WETIIIM

uasueH 112qoy

qoo) 119qoy
OSNIIRWWI BT I010TA
JNooqisisang praed
[1op1eo Loy

UosjeISND SUNISHYD
AedoN sowre[

10kaN paidis

suroog *d WeTIIM
191810 baipuy

uo1Ing pIeyory

o3eisusrq ‘[ uaydails
1owy31T uyof

1o1e7 soudy

urfreN ueof

Ieuuod,o ¥ ydesof
2321100 11RIARIN-USSPUNWIY
sso1d Arstoatup o3priqued
*ouy ‘s1aysIiqnd umoid
sorrddng A1e1qr7 oowaQg
sortddng A1eiqr1 oowag
sso1d AI1SI9ATU) BIQUINIOD
SISUQIIOG SS[IBYD
SOUIYORIN 2013JO uoidurwey
UoSTIM "M "H

*ouJ ‘s$91d MOIDDIBOS
*OU] ‘S[qON?Z Souled
d4Avd

STANLIANIIXI ANNd TYNOILYONdd



66°9%¢ ‘38$

G1°G96 ‘T
03°966 ‘S
087918
0L %9% ‘L
00°€GT
00°9¢T
00°TS
0G6°G3
06°S%
0G°L2Y

05’ 8

INNOWV
2DdHO

%

STINIIANAIXAE

aNnd TvYNOILVONdd TV.IOL

7095
L6SS

965G
S6GS
7655
£€66G
365G
166S
06SS
685G
88GS

JIGINNN

ADdHO

1°G96 ‘1
03°G66 ‘€
087918
0L %97 ‘L
00°€GT
00°9¢€T
00°TG
08°S2
0662
0S°L3T
06°S% $

INNOWV
ILNNODOV

08°206-6-T
08°206-G-T
08°206-S-T
08°208-G-T
08°206-G-T
08°20G-G-T
08°20S-G-T
08°206-S-T
08°206-G-1
08°20G-G-T

JIGNNN
ILNNODOV

JUSWasING WISy

yoeg o81eyD
yoeg 281eyD
yoeg 281eyD
yoeg 281eyD
3yoeg a81eyD
yoeg a81eyd
yoeg a81eyD
yoeg 281eyD
yoeg a81eyD
yoeg a81eyD

NOILdI¥O SAd

pung 1saxdwy

“spall ‘ Surpie[so BI9A ‘983103 WSUM
281100 doo 2yl

28o110D ArunwiwoD urdry

2851100 LArunwwod urdy

pusIyag uk[ieN

D{SUT[21Z SUNISLYD

UBWISYS SUS[IY

$100Y Uuea[
SpIeyOTy 3a[

preuod OeN WeIIIM

d4Avd

L96T ‘11 AVIN STINLIANIIXE D%. - TVYNOILVOD Nd3



€8°096'c ¢
767681

STINLIANIIXE ANNA ONIATING TVIOL

£099 $6'68T 29°809-3 ey Areiqry $13 10111STQ T00YoS YStH dmysumol

£6°8T0°T %098 £6°810°T 29°809-3 U9y 30O apuo] ®1 Loy
$%°986 1098 %986 $5°908-3 UssejN - 901AI9S suoydsial fuedwo) suoydaal 11og SIOUTII
oL T 0098 oL T %5°908-3 firomoord £uedwoD UOSIPF YIreaMUOWIWOD
00°G6 66GGC 00°¢6 02°90C-2 midy - sourualUTRN 90TAISS 90UBUDIUTBIN 159 HOOIWERYS
00°00¢ $ 868G 00°00¢ $ 0%°90G-3 9% fe1Q - $901AI0S [RNIOBNUOD sIopIing 131eyD
INNONY YIINNN INNOWY YIINNN NOLLAI¥OS3d JIAVd

MOIHD MDIHD INNODOV INNODDV

L96T ‘1T AVIN

L9009 SIONITII ‘ANILVTVd

IS 'ON L1ONLSIa
IOdTI0D mmmmA LANIVY S WVITTIIM

STINLIIANIAXT dNN4 ONIATING



"00°%89 ‘L2T§

00°$32

STYNLIIANIdXT TVIOL

OLT 0035 63°395-9 Sunsa1 1108 uonreiodio) 9014195 BunIsa L,

007096 ‘921 691 00096 ‘93T $3°299-9 $1091121Y 11008 112[MOY [IpNED

00°005 ¢ 891 00008 $ 33" 395-9 §9071413S 1€897] SOUTH * N Yueld

INNOWV YIINON INNOWV JITNNN NOILdIDSAd qdAVd
MOFHD MOFHD INNODDV INNODDV

L9009  SIONITII ‘ANILVTVd
218 "ON INIYISIA
1937100 mﬁmﬁﬁ NIVY IWVITIIM

L96T ‘IT AVIN - STUNIIANAdXT ANNd NOLLDMILSNOD ANV dLIS




WILLIAM RAINEY HARPER COLLEGE
DISTRICT NO., 512
EDUCATIONAL FUND

STATEMENT OF POSITION

ACCOUNT

ASSETS NUMBER
Cash:

Imprest Fund 101.20

In Bank 101.30

Deposits 101.80
Investments 102.10

TOTAL ASSETS

Liabilities

Payroll Deductions Payable:

Retirement 204.10
Survivors Insurance 204.11
Federal Income Tax Withheld 204.20
Social Security 204.31

Reserve for Encumbrances

TOTAL LIABILITIES

~und Balance

Fund Balance 300.00

TOTAL LIABILITIES & FUND BALANCE

Summary of Fund Balance

Balance July 1, 1966
Add: Revenues to Date

Less : Expenditures

FUND BALANCE

4/30/617 UNENCUMBERED
BALANCES ENCUMBRANCES BALANCES
$ 5,000.00 3 - $ 5,000.00
(24,224.16) - (24,224.16)
300.00 - 300.00
170,808.00 - 170, 808.00
$151,883.84 $ - $151,883.84
$ - $ - $ -
- 79,742 .84 79, 742 .84
$ - $ 79,742.84 $ 79,742.84
$151,883.84 $ (79, 742.84) $ 72,141.00
$151,883.84 $ - $151,883.84
$(16,747.79) $ - $(16,747.179)
479, 887.32 - 479, 887.32
463,139.53 - 463,139.53
311, 255.69 79, 742.84 390, 998.53
$151,883.84 $ (79,742.84) $ 72,141.00
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WILLIAM RAINEY HARPER COLLEGE
DISTRICT NO. 612
BUILDING FUND REPORT
STATEMENT OF POSITION

ACCOUNT . 4/30/67 UNENCUMBERED

ASSETS NUMBER BALANCES ENCUMBRANCES BALANCES
Cah:

Cash in Bank 101.30 $31,873.07 3 - $31,873.07
Investments 102.10 68,577.94 - 68,577.94

TOTAL ASSETS $100,451.01 - $100,451.01
Liabilities
Reserve for Encumbrances $ - $ 2,560.83 $ 2,560.83
Fund Balance
Fund Balance 300.00 $100,451.01 $ (2,560.83) $97,890.18

—_—
TOTAL LIABILITIES AND FUND BALANCE

Summary of Fund Balance

Balance - July 1,1966
Add: Revenue to Date

Deduct: Expenditures to Date

BALANCE

$100,451.01 - $100,451.01
$ - $ - $ -
130, 629.48 - 130, 629.48
$130,629.48 3 - $130,629.48
30,178.47 2,560.83 32,739.30
$100,451.01 $ (2,560.83) $97,890.18
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WILLIAM RAINEY HARPER COLLEGE
DISTRICT NO. 512

SITE & CONSTRUCTION FUND REPORT

STATEMENT OF POSITION

ACCOUNT 4/30/67 UNENCUMBERED
ASSETS NUMBER BALANCES ENCUMBRANCES BALANCES
Cash;
Cash in Bank - 1st National Bank of Chgo. 101.31 $ 51,441.72 $ - $  51,441.72
Investments 102.10 5,525,000.00 - 5,525,000.00
TOTAL ASSETS $5,576,441.72 3 - $5,576,441.72
Liabilities
Reserve for Encumbrances 3 - $ 127,684.00 127, 684.00
Fund Balance
Fund Balance 300.00 5,676,441.72 (1217, 684.00) 5,448,757.72
TOTAL LIABILITIES & FUND BALANCE 5,576,441.72 - 5,576,441.72
_—
‘Summary of Fund Balance
Balance - July 1, 1966 - -
Add: Revenues to Date 7,480,298.61 - 7,480,298.61
7,480,298.61 - 7,480,298.61
Deduct: Expenditures to Date 1,908,856.89 127,684.00 2,031,540.89

Balance $5,576,441.72 $(127, 684.00) $5,448,757.72
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BOARD ACTION

EXHIBIT A

FACULTY APPOINTMENTS

Electronics

Roger A. Mussell - Assistant Professor of Electronics - $10,150

B.S. Industrial Ed., 1963 and M.S. Vocational Ed., 1965 from
Stout State University in Menomonie, Wisconsin; University of
Houston - Summers 1964 and 1965; University of Illinois -
Summer 1966; 1966-67 NSF grant in Electronics Technology.
30+graduate hours beyond the masters.

Major Areas: Electronics

Teaching Experience: Menomonie Vocational School 1962-63;

North Central Technical Institute (Wausau, Wisconsin) 1963-66.
About 3 years equivalent professional experience in Radio-TV
(Menomonie); Remington Rand Univac; Cablevision, Wausau, Wisconsin.

Age 28. Married, three children. Resides at 1816 Southwood
Drive, Champaign, Illinois.
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BOARD ACTION
EXHIBIT B

SUBJECT
Dental Hygiene Program

REASON FOR CONSIDERATION BY BOARD

Program approval and authorization to continue facility
planning, personnel planning, and program development.

INFORMATION

On April 10 at a meeting of the Harper Dental Hygiene
Advisory Committee careful consideration was given to

the possibilities of beginning such a program. Follow-
ing a thorough discussion a motion was made and unani-
mously passed to recommend to the Harper Board of Trustees
that a program in Dental Hygiene be started in the fall

of 1968.

Much information was presented to substantiate the need
for such a program. Some of the salient points were:

a. Illinois has only two programs in Dental
Hygiene at present. In 1966 these programs
graduated 46 Hygienists.

b. The estimated need for dental hygienists in
the Chicago metropolitan area is for over
150 graduates per year.

c. Dental Hygiene is a growing profession.
Hygienists tend to be used more by younger
dentists leading to the belief that their
use by dentists will grow in the years to
come. Currently 22% of the dentists in the
country use hygienists.

d. The dental profession is moving toward plac-
ing more responsibility on their auxilaries.
The hygienist as the most highly trained of
these auxilaries will undoubtedly receive
more responsibilities in the years ahead
increasing their importance and use to the
dentists.



Iv.

EXHIBIT B

e. Several of the dentists on the advisory
committee have had difficulties obtaining
the services of a hygienist in recent years,
and one has been looking and advertising
for over a year without success.

f. Mr. Ben Miller, III, of the American Council
on Dental Education, Miss Louise Dailey of
the Office of the State Superintendent of
Public Instruction, and Mrs. Janet Burnham
of the Department of Health, Education and
Welfare, Dental Health Division, have visited
the college and discussed a possible program
with us. They all agreed it was needed in
this area and that beginning in the fall of
1968 was entirely feasible.

g. See addendum for anticipated costs.
SUMMARY

Based on the above information and other data reviewed
with the advisory committee, it is the conclusion of
the Harper College administration that the recommenda-
tion of the advisory committee is sound and should be
adopted.

RECOMMENDATION

The President recommends that the Board of Trustees
approve the establishment of a Dental Hygiene program
to begin in the fall of 1968.



EXHIBIT B

ANTICIPATED COSTS OF A DENTAL HYGIENE PROGRAM

Following is an approximation of the costs entailed in begin-

ning a Dental Hygiene program for a class of 32 students.

It

should be noted that for an approved program the state will

reimburse the college 100% on the cost of equipment, and 66%
on the salaries of staff members. Beyond the initial equip-
ment costs the money needed for maintaining the program will
involve salaries and minimal charges for expendable supplies.

Initial Egquipment Costs for 1968 and 1969

Total
1968 1969 Cost
32 Mannikins @ $100 - $ 3,200
Files & miscellaneous office equipment- 800
1 Secretarial-receptionist station - 500
4 Standard offices equipped - 1,400(2) 1,400(2)
16 Operatories @ $3,000
(dental chair, unit, light) = 48,000
2 X-ray units @ $3,000
(dental chair, X-ray unit) - 6,000
2 Dark rooms and equipment - 2,400
2 Cavatrons @ $800 - 1,600
Casting machine, autoclave, dry
clave, inlay furnace, refrigerator,
trays and miscellaneous equipment - 4,000
$ 5,900 63,400 §$ 69,300
Salaries 1968 1969
Director of Program (D.D.S.) $ 20,000 20,000
Secretary 5,000 5,000
Registered Dental Hygienist (M.A.) 10,000 10,000
Registered Dental Hygienist(B.A.orM.A.) 8,500
Registered Dental Hygienist (B.A.or M.A.) 8,500
$ 35,000 52,000 §$ 87,000
Grand Total - §$ 156,300




L _ ExHiBr7 2"
FOR BOARD ACTION:

I. SUBJECT:

Site preparation and electrical utilities for relocatable
facilities.

II. REASON FOR CONSIDERATION BY THE BOARD:

Pursuant to board purchasing policy, specifications have
been established and bids have been solicited for necessary
work to install relocatable facilities at Elk Grove. The
lowest bid exceeds $5,000. and requires board action to
award the contract.

III. INFORMATION:

The work involved in site preparation for the Elk Grove site
includes the following:

1. 192 wooden piles (24 per building) driven to a depth
of ten feet below ground.

2. Eight 6' x 6' wooden platforms (front) with steps set
on five concrete piers.

3. Eight 4' x 6' wooden platforms (back) with steps set
on four concrete piers.

4. Approximately 2250 square feet of sidewalk, four inches
thick placed on 2" of gravel.

5. All electrical requirements (underground) necessary to
service all units.

6. Outside light at the front of each unit with three
adjustable lamps per unit.

In addition to advertising (as per policy), bids were solicited
from contractors throughout the Chicago area.

A total of six contractors requested drawings and specifi-
cations. All contractors indicated they intended to submit bids
for this project. However, bhids were received as follows:



FOR BOARD ACTION:

General Contractors

Walson Construction,
Bensenville, Ill.

Lake States Corp.
Park Ridge

Meyer & Gebhardt
Chicago

Electrical Contractors

Prime Base
Bid I
(Site Pre-

Midwest Interstate
Chicago

Mid America Electric
Palatine

Northbrook Electric
Northbrook

paration)

$22,725.00
No Bid

No Bid .

Prime Base

General Base

Bid II Bid III
(Electrical) (Combined)
$5,500.00 $28,225.00
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
$7,563.00

5,830.00

6,311.00

On May 10, the above bids were evaluated by representatives
from Fridstein & Fitch and the business office staff.

IV. SUMMARY:

Although bids have exceeded our most recent estimates, we
have been assured by our architects that the low bid is in
line with current costs in view of the time of year and the

size of the job.

V. RECOMMENDATION :

The president recommends that the Board of Trustees award
the site preparation and electrical contract to the low
bidder namely the Walson Construction Company of Bensenville,

for a total bid figure of $28,225.00.
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